ORDINANCE NO. 1409

AN ORDINANCE WHICH PROVIDES AMENDMENT TO THE CODE
OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF YUKON, OKLAHOMA BY
AMENDING SECTIONS 204-106, 204-107 AND 204-111 OF THE
CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF YUKON BY ADOPTING
THE INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE 2015 EDITION AND
PROVIDING ADDITIONS, INSERTIONS, AND DELETIONS THERETO
AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL FOR THE CITY OF YUKON, OKLAHOMA that the
Code of Ordinances, City of Yukon, is hereby amended by adopting the International
Mechanical Code and providing for additions, insertions, and deletfions thereto as
follows:

SECTION 1:
Sec. 204-106. International Mechanical Code Adopted.

That certain documents, 3 copies of which are on file in the office of the city clerk,
being marked and designated as International Mechanical Code 2015 Edition, as
published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the
code of the city for regulating the design, construction, quality of materials,
erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition
to use or maintenance of mechanical systems in the City of Yukon and providing for
the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefore; and each and all of the
regulations, provisions, conditions and terms of such, as amended and modified by
the Uniform Building Code Commission pursuant to 59 O.S. § 1000.23 as it may from
fime to time be amended and subsequent amendments as lisied below of the
Code of Ordinances, is hereby adopted as the Code of the City; as herein
provided; and each and all regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms
of said Mechanical code are hereby refered to, adopted., and made a part
hereof, as it fully set out in this article with additions, insertions, deletions and
changes.

Sec. 204-107. Office of mechanical inspector created; general powers and duties
hereby amended to read.

The office of the mechanical heating and air conditioning inspector is hereby
created within the department of Development Services. The Development Service
Director shall appoint the mechanical inspector and he may hold another posifion
in the city government. The mechanical inspector shall have the powers and duties
prescribed by the mechanical code adopted by this article. It shall be his duty to
see that all laws, ordinances, codes, rules and regulations related to mechanical
systems are properly enforced.



ORD 1409 Page 2 of 11

Sec. 204-108. - Registration required amended to read.

No person shall engage in the following without first registering with the mechanical,
heating and air conditioning inspector and obtaining a mechanical registration
certificate from the city:

a. Maintain, repair, or renovate, in whole or in part, of any heating system,
cooling system, mechanical refrigerafion system, ventilation system, any
equipment or piping carmying chilled water, air for ventilation purposes, or
piping carrying natural gas.

b. Maintain, repair, or renovate process piping used to carry any liquid,
substance, material, including steam and hot water used for space heating
purposes not under the jurisdiction of the department of labor.

Sec. 204-109. - Issuance of registration certificate.

1)

2)

Registration certificate under this article will be issued upon the applicant's
showing to the satisfaction of the mechanical heating and air conditioning
inspector proof of a current and valid mechanical license from the state and the
payment of the annual fee as set forth in section 204-110. The continued validity
of such registration shall be dependent upon the person maintaining a current,
valid state mechanical license and the expiration, revocation or suspension of a
state mechanical license shall automatically invalidate the registration
certificate of the city. Any person continuing to engage in mechanical work
without a valid city registration or permit shall be subject to the provisions set
forth on section 204-113.

An annual registration issued under this section may be renewed by paying the
prescribed fee on or before August 31, and shall be considered surrendered if
not renewed within 15 days thereafter. Any person having surrendered his
certificate must proceed in the manner required for a new or initial application.

Sec. 204-110. - Registration fees.

The registration fee for persons employed at installing, replacing or repairing gas
pipes, appliances or other mechanical work shall be set by the city council by
resolution.

Sec. 204-111. Additions, inserlions and deletions International Mechanical Code.

CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

Section 106.1.1 Annual permit is amended to read as follows:

106.1.1. Annual Permit. An annual permit is a yearly permit which represents a group
of individual permits for each alteration to an already approved electrical, gas,
mechanical or plumbing installation. The building official is authorized to issue an
annual permit upon application therefor to any person, firm or premises owned or
operated by the applicant for the permit.

(OUBCC Amendment)



ORD 1409 Page 3 of 11

Section 106.1.2 Annual permit records is amended to read as follows:

106.1.2. Annual permit records. The person to whom an annual permit is issued shall

keep a detailed record of alterations at all times. At the completion of the entity’s

annual permit term, the applicant shall file such detailed records of alterations with

the building official. Pursuant to the authority of 59 O.S. § 1000.25, the building

official shall collect fees for each individual permit which is part of the annual permit

once the detailed records are submitted and remit such fees fo the OUBCC.
(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 106.5.2 Fee Schedule is hereby amended to read as follows:

106.5.2 Fee Schedule. Any mechanical confractor who intends to erect, install,
enlarge, alter, repair, remove, convert mechanical systems, the installation of which
is regulated by this code or to cause any such work to be done, shall first make
application to the Development Services Department and obtain the required
permit and shall pay all such required permit fees and any additional fees. All such
fees shall be set by resolution by the City Council.

Section 107.8 Inspection access is amended to read as follows:

107.8 inspection Access. It shall be the responsibility of the mechanical contractor to
provide access to all mechanical equipment and appliances to the code official for
all required inspections. Where equipment and appliances are located in remote
locations or at different floor or roof levels the contractor shall provide an approved
ladder for inspection access. Where a pull-down ladder is provided, the ladder shall
be installed with the top step facing in the direction of the access passageway and
toward the highest side of the roof decking. It shall also be the responsibility of the
mechanical confractor o coordinate all required inspections with the property
owner or the owner's agent and the code official. Mechanical inspection personnel
shall be available for such coordination between the hours of 8:30 am - 5:00 pm
Monday through Friday, except holidays.

Section 108.5 Stop work order is amended to read as follows:

108.5 Stop work order. Upon notice from the Development Services Director or
designee, work on any mechanical system that is being done contrary to the
provisions of this code or in a dangerous or unsafe manner shall immediately cease.
Such notice shail be in writing and shall be given to the owner of the property, the
owner's agent or to the person doing the work. The notice shall state the conditions
under which work is authorized to resume. Where an emergency exists, the
Development Services Director or designee shall not be required to give a written
notice prior to stopping the work. Any person who shall continue any work in or
about the structure after having been served with a stop work order, except such



ORD 1409 Page 4 of 11

work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition,
shall be guilty of an offense and upon conviction shall be punished as provided in
Section 1-7 of the Code of Ordinances.

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS
Definition of the term “appliances” has hereby been deleted.
(OUBCC Amendment)
CHAPTER 3 GENERAL REGULATIONS

Section 301.12 is amended to read as follows:

301.15 Wind Resistance. Mechanical equipment, appliances and supports that are
exposed to wind shall be designed and installed to resist the wind pressures
determined in accordance with the International Building Code, SMACNA HVAC
Duct Construction Standards — Metal and Flexible, or other methods as approved by
the code official.

(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 303.4.1 Construction equipment is added to read as follows:

M303.4.1 Construction equipment. Construction equipment such as backhoes,
other motorized earth moving equipment, etc., or sand-moving extensions of such
equipment shall not travel within or over a stem wall area or foundation
perimeter after plumbing, electrical or mechanical ducts, piping, equipment or
materials have been installed.

Exception:

Construction eqguipment shall be permitted within said prohibited areas where such
equipment does not travel over or adjacent to any duct, piping, equipment or
materials subjecting them to physical damage, provided however that the code
official shall be nofified prior to the work and provided that the code official shall
verify that no damage is done to the installation.

Section 304.3 Elevation of ignition source is amended to delete the exception:

304.3 Elevation of ignition source. Equipment and appliances having an ignition
source and located in hazardous locations and public garages, private garages,
repair garages, automotive motor fuel-dispensing facilities and parking garages
shall be elevated such that the source of ignition is not less than 18 inches (457 mm)
above the floor surface on which the equipment or appliance rests. For the purpose
of this section, rooms or spaces that are not part of the living space of a dwelling
unit and that communicate directly with a private garage through openings shail
be considered to be part of the private garage.



ORD 1409 Page 5 of 11

(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 304.3.2 is added to read as follows:
304.3.2 Hazardous location installation.

a) Fuel burning central heating units shall be installed in accordance with Sections
M303 and M304 of the International Mechanical Code, 2015 Edition, except that
no fuel burning central heating units shall be installed under a stairwell.

Exception: This requirement shall not apply to areas under stairwells that are
sprinkler protected.

b) Appliances such as central heating units shall be installed in accordance
with Sections M303 and M304 of the International Mechanical Code, 2015
Edition. Fuel-burning ceniral heating units and fuel-burning water heaters
installed in a garage or other hazardous location shall be protected by -
enclosing in a closet and comply with Section FG304.6, "Outdoor Combustion Air”
of the International Fuel Gas Code, 2015 Edition. Where combustion air is taken
from a hazardous location, no portion of a combustion air opening shall be
located within 24 inches of the floor.

c) Gas combustion type appliances and equipment installed in rooms or closets
with doors which open to a garage or other hazardous location shall be
installed in accordance with Sections M303 and M304 of this Code and the
combustion air for such equipment shall be provided from an outdoor
source unless otherwise approved.

(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 304.11 Guards is amended to read as follows:

304.11 Guards. Guards shall be provided where various components that require
service relocated on a roof or elevated structure and have a condition as set forth
in Sections 304.11.1 through 304.11.3. The top of the guard shall be located not less
than 42 inches (1067 mm} above the elevated surface adjacent to the guard. The
guard shall be constructed so as to prevent the passage of a 21-inch diameter (533
mm) sphere and shall comply with the loading requirements for guards as specified
in the International Building Code®. Guards shall be provided at new components
when added or replaced on an existing roof or elevated structure and have a
condition as set forth in Sections 304.11.1 through 304.11.3. Excepftion: When
approved by the authority having jurisdiction, guards are not required where
permanent fall arrest/restraint anchorage connector devices that comply with
ANSI/ASSE 7 359.1 are daffixed for use during the entire roof covering lifetime. The
devices shall be reevaluated for possible replacement when the entire roof
covering is replaced. The devices shall be placed not more than 10 feet (3048 mm)



ORD 1409 Page 6 of 11

on center along hip and ridge lines and placed not less than 10 feet (3048 mm) from
roof edges and the open sides of walking surfaces..

(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 304.11.1 Roof edge is added to read as follows:

304.11.1 Roof edge. Guards complying with 304.11 shall be provided when
components are located within 10 feet (3048 mm) of a roof edge or open side of a
walking surface or elevated structure and such edge or open side is located more
than 30 inches (762 mm) above the floor, roof, or grade below. The guard shall

extend not less than 30 inches (762 mm) beyond each end of the component that
requires service.
(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 304.11.2 Skylights is added to read as follows:

304.11.2 Skylights. This section has been added to clarify the circumstances for the
installation of guards around components near skylights and to provide exceptions
to the requirement. This section has been added to read: 304.11.2 Skylights. Guards
complying with Section 304.11 shall be provided when a skylight is within 10 feet
(3048 mm) of the component that requires service. The guard shall extend 30 inches
(762 mm]) beyond the edge of the skylight.

Exceptions:

a) Guards are not required when the skylight is located at least 42 inches (1067 mm)
above the highest point of the walking surface adjacent to the skylight or
component,

b) Guards are not required if some other provision for skylight fall-through protection
is provided and approved by the authority having jurisdiction.

(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 304.11.3 Roof hatch is added to read as follows:

304.11.3 Roof hatch. Guards complying with Section 304.11 shall be provided when
a roof hatch is within 10 feet (3048 mm) of the component that requires service. The
guard shall extend 30 inches {762 mm) beyond the edge of the roof hatch. If the
component is within 10 feet (3048 mm) of the ladder access side of the roof hatch,
the guard shall incorporate a self-closing, self-latiching gate. The gate shall have a
fop edge of not less than 42 inches (1067 mm) above the elevated surface
adjacent to the gate and shall not allow the passage of a 21 inch {533 mm) sphere.
If a roof hatch exists within 10 feet of a roof edge that is located more than 30
inches (762 mm) above the floor, roof or grade below and a new component that
requires services on that existing roof or elevated structure, than a guard complying



ORD 1409 Page 7 of 11

with Section 304.11 shail be added between the existing roof hatch and the roof
edge.
(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 305.5.1 Location and protection of refrigerant piping is added to read as follows:

305.5.1 Location and protection of refrigerant piping. Refrigerant piping installed
within 1 1/2 inches (38 mm) of the underside of roof decks shall be protected from
damage caused by nails and other fasteners.

(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 306.5 Equipment and appliances on roofs or elevated structures is added to
read as follows:

306.5 Equipment and appliances on roofs or elevated structures: Where equipment
requiring access or appliances are located on an elevated structure or the roof of a
building such that personnel will have to climb higher than 16 feet (4877 mm) above
grade to access such equipment or appliances, an interior or exterior means of
access shall be provided. Such access shall not require climbing over obstructions
greater than 30 inches (762 mm) in height or walking on roofs having a slope greater
than 4 units vertical in 12 units horizontal (33-percent slope). Such access shall not
require the use of portable ladders. Where access involves climbing over parapet
walls, the height shall be measured to the top of the parapet wall.
a) Permanent ladders installed to provide the required access shall comply with
the following minimum design criteria:

1} The side railing shall extend above the parapet or roof edge not less than
30 inches (762 mm).

i.i. Ladders shall have rung spacing not to exceed 14 inches (356 mm)
on center. The uppermost rung shall not be greater than 24 inches (610
mm) below the upper edge of the roof hatch, roof or parapet, as
applicable.

2) Ladders shall have a toe spacing not less than 6 inches (152 mm) deep.

3) There shall be not less than 18 inches (457 mm) between rails.

4) Rungs shall have a diameter not less than 0.75-inch (19 mm) and be
capable of withstanding a 300-pound (136.1 kg) load.

5) Ladders over 30 feet (9144 mm)] in height shall be provided with offset
sections and landings capable of withstanding 100 pounds per square
foot (488.2 kg divided by meters squared). Landing dimensions shall be
not less than the width of the ladder served. A guard rail shall be provided
on all open sides of the landing.

6) Climbing clearance. The distance from the centerline of rungs to the
nearest permanent object on the climbing side of the ladder shall be not
less than 30 inches (762 mm) measured perpendicular to the rungs. This
distance shall be maintained from the point of ladder access to the
bottom of the roof hatch. A minimum clear width of 15 inches (381 mm)



ORD 1409 Page 8 of 11

shall be provided on both sides of the ladder measured from the midpoint
of and parallel with the rungs except where cages or wells are instalied.

7) Landing required. The ladder shall be provided with a clear and
unobstructed bottom landing area having a minimum dimension of 30
inches (762 mm) by 30 inches (762 mm) centered in front of the ladder.

8) Ladders shall be protected against corrosion by an approved means.

9) Access to ladders shall be provided at all times.

b) Catwalks installed to provide the required access shall be not less than 24
inches (610 mm) wide and shall have railings as required for service platforms.

Exceptions:

1. This section shall not apply to Group R-3 occupancies.
2. This section shall not apply to appliance replacement.
(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 307.2.1 Condensate disposal is added to read as follows:

307.2.1 Condensate disposal. Condensate from all cooling coils and evaporators
shall be conveyed from the drain pan outlet to an approved place of disposal. Such
piping shall maintain a minimum horizontal slope in the direction of discharge of not
less than one-eighth unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (1-percent slope). Condensate
drains shall be allowed to terminate to an approved pit or French drain consisting of
a minimum of 24 inches by 24 inches by 24 inches (610 mm by 610 mm by 610 mm),
or equivalent; of 1 inch (25 mm) washed rock. Such pits or French drains shall be
located 30 inches (762 mm) minimum from outer edge of foundation to nearest
edge of pit or French drain. Condensate shall not discharge into a street, alley or
other areas so as to cause a nuisance.

(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 307.2.3.1 Water-level monitoring devices is added to read as follows:

307.2.3.1 Water-level monitoring devices. On down-flow units and all other coils that
do not have a secondary drain or provisions to install a secondary or auxiliary drain
pan, a water-level monitoring device shall be installed inside the primary drain pan.
This device shall shut off the equipment served in the event that the primary drain
becomes restricted. Devices installed in the drain line shall not be permitted.
Exception: This section shall not apply to appliances installed in areas outside on the
ground or elevated structure where condensate overflow does not damage
building components or contents.
(OUBCC Amendment)



ORD 1409 Page ? of 11

CHAPTER 5 EXHAUST SYSTEMS

Section [F] 502.15 Repair garages is added to read as follows:

[F] 502.15 Repair garages. Where Class | liquids or LP-gas are stored or used within a
building having a basement or pit wherein flammable vapors could accumulate,
the basement or pit shall be provided with ventilation designed in accordance with
Section 2311.4.3 of the International Fire Code® to prevent the accumulation of
flammable vapors therein.

(OUBCC Amendment)

Section [F] 502.16.1 Design is added to read as follows:

[F] 502.16.1 Design. Indoor locations shall be ventilated utilizing air supply inlets and
exhaust outlets arranged to provide uniform air movement to the extent practical.
Inlets shall be uniformly arranged on exterior walls near floor level. Outlets shall be
located within 18 inches (457 mm) of the high point of the room in exterior walls or
the roof. Ventilation shall be by a continuous mechanical ventilation system or by a
mechanical ventilation system activated by a continuously monitoring natural gas
detection system, or for hydrogen, a continuously monitoring flammable gas
detection system, each activating at a gas concentration of not more than 25
percent of the lower flammable limit (LFL). In all cases, the system shall shut down
the fueling system in the event of failure of the ventilation system. The ventilation
rate shall not be less than 1 cubic foot per minute per square foot [0.0051 cubic
meters per (second square meter)] of room area.

(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 506.3.6 Grease duct clearances is hereby amended to read as follows:

506.3.6 Grease duct clearances. Where enclosures are not required, Type 1 grease
ducts shall be installed according to NFPA 96. Field applied grease duct enclosures
shall be installed to ASTM E2336 Standards. A double wrap is required.

ASTM E2336 requires compliance to 5 fire tests as follows:

1. Section 16.1 requires non-combustibility to ASTM E136.

2. Section 16.2 requires 2-hour ASTM E119 Wall Panel Test.

3. Section 16.3. requires a durability test modeled after ASTM C518.

4. Section 16.4 requires an internal grease duct fire test to demonstrate
performance during long term exposure to service conditions (500 degree
Fahrenheit for 4 hours) and exposure to a standardized internal grease fire
(2000 degree Fahrenheit for 30 minutes).

5. Section 16.5 requires a fire engulfment test run to the ASTM E119 fire curve
which tests the capability of the duct and enclosure system to resist external
fires, tests the integrity of the enclosure fastening and tests the through-
penetration performance of the system.



ORD 1409 Page 10 of 11

Section 506.3.1.1 Grease duct materials is added to read as follows:

506.3.1.1 Grease duct materials. Grease ducts serving Type | hoods shall be
constructed of non-galvanized carbon steel having a minimum thickness of 0.0575

inch {1.463 mm) (No. 16 gage) or stainless steel not less than 0.0450 inch (1.14 mm)
(No. 18 gage) in thickness.

Exception: Factory-built commercial kitchen grease ducts listed and labeled in
accordance with UL 1978 and installed in accordance with Section 304.1.

(OUBCC Amendment)

Section 507.2. Type | hoods has been added to read as follows:

507.2. Type | hoods. Type | hoods shall be installed where cooking appliances
produce grease or smoke as a result of the cooking process. Type | hoods shall be
installed over medium-duty, heavy-duty, and extra-heavy-duty cooking appliances.

Exceptions:

a) A Type | hood shall not be required for an electric cooking applionce where
an approved testing agency provides documentation that the appliance
effluent contains 5 mg/m?® or less of grease when tested at an exhaust flow
rate of 500 cfm (0.236 mé/s) in accordance with UL 710B.

b) In non-commercial cooking occupancies a residential or Type Il hood can be
installed over a medium-duty residential appliance when approved.

(OUBCC Amendment)

CHAPTER 6 DUCT SYSTEMS

Sec. 204-112. - Discontinving service to dangerous installations hereby amended to
read:

204-112 Discontinue service fo dangerous installations. The mechanical or plumbing
inspector shall instruct the gas company to discontinue gas service to any residence
or business in the city when, in his judgment, the gas installation is dangerous. Gas
service will remain shut off until such time as corrections are made by a licensed
installing agency and approved by the city.

Sec. 204-113. - Violations and penalties hereby amended to read:

204-113 Violations and penalfies. Any person who shall violate a provision of this
code or who fails to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect,
install, alter or repair mechanical work in violation of this code, or in violation of a
detailed statement or plan submitted and approved hereunder, or of a permit or
certificate issued hereunder, shall be guilty of an offense and upon conviction shall
be punished as provided in section 1-7 of the Code of Ordinances.



ORD 1409 Page 11 of 11

SECTION 2:

All other provisions established by this section shall remain the same, as if specifically
set out herein.

SECTION 3:

That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is, for
any reason, held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of
the remaining portions of this ordinance. The City of Yukon hereby declares that it
would have passed this law, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase thereof,
irespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences,
clauses and phrases be declared unconstitutional.

Secs. 204-114—204-135. - Reserved.
SECTION 4: EMERGENCY:

WHEREAS, it being immediately necessary for the preservation of the peace,
health, safety and public good of the City of Yukon and the inhabitants thereof that the
provisions of this ordinance be put into full force and effect, an emergency is hereby
declared to exist by reason whereof this ordinance shall take effect, and be in full force
from and after its passage, as provided by law.

PASSED AND APPROVED this 814 day of A-UGUS:’ , 2020, with the
Emergency Clause passed separately.




"_ - r
= T e T

AN (RRDHNANCE WHICH FROVIDES AMENDMENT TO THE CODE OF
MHHIMMMMIMHMNM
mmmmnmmmwmmnmu
FLUMEING COHE 00% EDITION AND FROVIDESG A DEIT s,
INSERTIONS, | AND DELETHONS THERETO AND DECLARING AN

EMERGENCY,
SECTION 4 Emergeney.
WHEREAR, i being Peceisary for the prowmaton of the peace, hoalth, safcty and bl pocd
nr'lltfh-#'l'nhuHﬂthﬁwhlhpﬁumﬂﬁmummnumu |

mumhmﬂmuﬂuwmnmmﬂmcnﬂuhhu
Fistiot oy el ity 18 prisagrc. i proidod by b,

MMILWWIHHIMM#&_MMHE&bpqimmd
iy,

Khurili Sefby, Mayor =
Dhougles A. Shivors, Ciry Clerk
{SHAL)

L

Pk b Fkom Prspren on Jages 13 NN
CHUDNRA NCE ol s

AN DRBINANCE WHICH FROVIDES AMENDMENT TO THE CODE o4F
DRMNANCTS OF THE CITY (0F YURRN, (K LAHOM Y By AN ST G
SECTIONS B | 86, RE. §i™ AND Pk} (F THE COBE A0F QYRR N AN TS O
miﬂﬂmn'ﬁhurnﬁ-:mtlmnnmummtm.
CORE 2003 EDITION AND PROVITMNG ADMMTIONS, INSERTRONS, AN
BELETIONS THERETO AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY

SECTHIN & Emergency.

WHEREAS. 1 being immedsaehy Reecoviany 4or th peeicrvation of the prace, hoalth, safety arad bl g
Hhmﬂﬂﬂﬂhmhﬂmhmhﬂﬁm e st brdis A0 Fomipg el
effect, an emseegeray b henchy declared o exist by reson whoel this ardinasce ahall ke cfio, s b in full
frcs frorn e afler it puscage. s prosided by Lva

FASSED AND AFPROVED this |58 day of Avgust, 2000 with the Userpeney Claus pasicd
*parately,

Shelli Sl Mo
Diughan A, Shivers. City Clork
(SEAL)

Pablivhe in Habose Py w Avgnae 1 WAy
CHEHN ARCE Wi f410

huummq.rmmrmnm.qu'a.m 20 with the Ememgoncy Clase passed

Shell Selly. Mayor
Dhvusglon A Shibera Ciy Clerk
{SEAL)K

FPabdichad in Nuliom Progrens on dsgas 37 3000
CHEDESARCE WD, 5403

FROVEINCS AMENDMENT TO THE CODE oF
CITY OF YUKON, (RLABOMA BY AMENIHNG
BT AND 04T (R
VUKD &Y AIMNPFTING
THE NATIONAL ELECTRECAL CODE 004 EIMTION AND PRAVWTENG
ARHTIONS, INSERTIONS, AXD I LETHONS THERETO AN ML AR NG
AN EMERGENCY

AN ORDINANCE WHIH
DREHMANCES OF TIIE

PASSED AND APFROVED this 18 dey of Asgant, 3030 whth she Frnovgencs Claue passed
e —

Shelk Sty My o ;
Deoughin A Shivery ity Clerk
(SEAL}

-
L ————————

e ————

AP Tkl i Habo Prvsgroas om gt 12, 30200
ORIINANCE Sy, 413

AN nmh.mmﬂ“ﬂlﬂﬁ’lﬂ:mmmmlﬁ“
MWHMWH-WHMMﬁ ny
AMEmhﬁmhhn.uﬂl.mm“Amﬁ:
ENTERNATHINAL BUILIMENG COBE 305 EOITRON AN PRAOYIDING
;mmmmﬂnimmummmmmm
mmmmm;w-mmmmzmﬂﬂ.

SECTHIN & Emergeney.

WHEHREAS, it bemyg immcdaicly, rogeswan for the prowiyanm of thy e, Bealth, maleny ard public pood

of the City of Yiekon gadd (he indushrms v thar the (o b oof dhili codnasee e pan st full foers and
etfiecL am emergency bs berehy deckaned b exist by reason whestol this ardinasce sball o efer, ared Be in ful
fromge fovsds andd afler i g, o provided by Lo

FASSETN AND APPROVER ks 15 day of Aegnt, 3000 with the Prorpeney Clane passed
ey

hai [ Sifbey, Pelapo
Pesaghani 4. Shivere, Chn Tk
(ALY

—ram

r-l;';-l'Tlln.l'm Haloss Progerras on A 2 iy )

CHUEHMANCE W, 1414

AN ORDINANCE WHMH FROVIDES AMENDMENT T THE CODE OF
OHIHNANCES OF THE CITY 00 VUKDN, OKLAHOMA BY AMENTHNG
SEUTIONS Did-Iie, JR-0Y7, 204080 AND 204188 BY AIKWTING THE
INTERNATIONAL RESIMENTIAL OOBE 3013 EDFTEOY FibH O%E- AND
TWIRFAMILY W ELLINGS, FROYVIDESG ADDITHINS, INSERTHINS, AN
BELETINS THEERETO AN OFCLARING A% EMERGENTY

Ia-:-r_mmrm

WHEREA%, ntqn;lznnkntnrrrmq'hlbrpnnrnﬂ:nﬂ'lkppmﬁuﬂulﬂ} e pakd pocd
ol the City of Yiskos ssed the Inhabvns ferod that the providhons of this ondinasce be pat imao full fovce and
efei L, am omieacds s in horoke dislaned b £xiad by escom whimpo!f this ofdnancy shall ke ofipcr, il B in (ol
rmhﬂﬂﬁhm.bmﬂﬂh'h

FASSED AND APPROYED this 136 day of Amgust, 2000 with the Emterpency Ul passcd

| separaichy,

Shelli Scbby, M
Lg% Shiwer, City Clork

CSEAL)

Pt (m J'iﬁul'ﬁ.ﬁln.r-.l;‘u' L Ny
CHEHNAMCE M0, 1415

AN OHIHMNANCE WHICH PROVIDES AMENDMENT TO THE COBE OF
DRODNANCES OF THE CITY OF VUKD, OKLAHOMA 1Y AMENDING
THE CONMMUNNATION TOWER (ERDENANDE MO, 1084 SECTI0N -7 (Hj
LA AT REQ IEEMENTS; AND DECLARING AN EMERGENCY,

SECTION L Emergeney.

| Anemerpeny is doclared b xisd s MW
ek wffoct rnercdisnsty upon pusaage. appeovel and publkstion acconding o L .

PASSED AND APPROVED thin 18 day of Ausguss, PO with the Frarpency Classe punscd
ey,

Shili Selby, Mayor
Prouglas A Shivers, Oy Clerk

ISEALj

{Prabiiohnd by Fillon Pogrra ooy fageat JF. Moy
CRECE A ROE N, 1408

AN DRBINANCE WHET FROVIDES AMENDMENT T THE CODE OF
DRMMANCES OF TIE COTY OF VUK, R LA O, Y ANENIN NG
SECTNS M1, ME-30, 1831, AE-d1, M) AND RESY BY ADBOPTING THE
TS INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE BY AMENDING SECTHINS §0L),
TRELE, IMEILL 104, 1114 DEFINITIONS, SO B0, 58600, WILLT, WLLE
51, WOT.L, LIS, 10056, BOILA D, 100563, PHISAN, 10ELT, 1194.0, 108L43,
HERLL, T00d, bR, EI.T.MMI.MI.MM?. IMTE T4,
MY, N1, YRR, AT, AMELT|, LS8, 1040, 0K, TANNAp,
EAE.Y, ARILTLLLD, SR ST, §00A 1, & B2 FROVIRING FEES BE SET By
BESOHLUTHEN OF THE CITY CTHINCILAND DECLARING 4N EMERZENCY




AFFIDAVIT OF PUBLICATION

Yukon Progress Publishing, LLC
P O Box 850499

Yukon, OK 73085
405-577-6208

Bill To:

CITY OF YUKON
P.0. BOX 850500
YUKON, OK 73085

Re ORD 1409

|, Harmony Patton, of lawful age, being duly sworn upon oath,
deposes | am the Authorized Agent of the Yukon Progress, a bi-
weekly publlcatlon that is a "legal newspaper" as that phrase is
defined in 25 0.S. Paragraph 106 for the City of Yukon, for the County
of Canadian, in the State of Oklahoma, and that the attachment
hereto contains a true and correct copy of what was published in
said legal newspaper in consecutive issues on the following dates

INSERTION DATES:

1% Insertion

August 22, 2020

Publication Fees:

State of Oklahoma, County of Canadian

Subscribed and sworn to before me this 24t

day of August 2020.

A

\\\\“»C ELLG "l/
Sa

‘-‘:r“"'-a.

oy O "Z’A
#1
EXP.

\
\\“\\

8012480
121 8/22}

NO

A
"W

M,

[l
7

Notary Public, # l Xb\ 2 ‘ ng

My Commlssmn Exp| es:

o
,,;,,
(o)

-..,UB\..

7, -m..n-
Y

o,

%2,
”46’
“n

\g\,

"'ummm\\“




